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As everyone knows, today the problem of youth 
in Uzbekistan is a priority in public policy. The 
work done since the independence of our 
country and now the leadership of the Republic 
on the path of youth maturity, personally our 
president, etc. M. The care provided by 
Mirziyoyev is a vivid proof of our opinion. 
(3.23.) In the introduction of the problem 
chosen by us, which is in tune with the demand 
of the period, the support of the president and 
the government of the Youth Union, an effective 
Institute for working with young people 
completely new, free from old ideological 
convictions, the allocation of special grants for 
young people to study in higher educational 
institutions, a new type After all, tomorrow is in 
the hands of our youth today. Therefore, raising 
the younger generation as a mature, perfect 
person in all respects, protecting their political, 
spiritual and social interests, especially in this 
regard, raising the responsibilities of state and 
non-governmental organizations in a 
fundamental sense, is one of the most pressing 
issues of the chosen topic. Promoting social 
protection of young people, holding events on 

the formation of national pride, a sense of 
loyalty to the motherland, comprehensive 
support for young people in a market economy, 
organizing new jobs for them, providing grants 
for high knowledge, searching for talented 
children in our republic and making them laugh 
is a requirement of the period. The current 
period, which is rapidly developing, should give 
our young people a decent education, make 
their aspirations for science come true. To this 
end, we need to develop the system of preschool 
education, radically improve the material and 
technical base of secondary and higher 
educational institutions, the quality of scientific 
and educational processes. 
    Through the spiritual and educational aspects 
of which the theoretical aspects of the article are 
more scientifically based, an attempt was made 
to shed light on the fact that it is advisable to 
carry out youth love for the motherland with 
attention to enlightenment. Decree of the 
president of the Republic of Uzbekistan dated 
August 4, 2018 No. 3898 "on radical 
improvement of the system of increasing the 
spiritual and educational level of military 
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personnel of the Armed Forces of the Republic 
of Uzbekistan"was adopted. In this regard, in the 
system of the Armed Forces of the Republic of 
Uzbekistan, every Friday of the week was 
designated as the "day of spiritual growth and 
patriotism".. It is aimed at increasing the 
feelings of courage, courage, pride and pride in 
young people and military personnel, 
strengthening the spiritual and educational 
knowledge of military personnel and their 
family members, forming in them a sense of 
patriotism, love for the motherland, loyalty to 
the National idea. The fact that young people, 
who make up about 65% of the population of 
our country, are a large socio-political force, on 
the one hand, imposes a huge responsibility on 
the state, and on the other hand, positive 
opportunities arise as a result of pursuing an 
acceptable youth policy. That is, the relationship 
between youth and the state is strengthened in 
the process of properly directing young people 
to life, creating material and spiritual conditions 
for them to take their place in life. It naturally 
serves for young people to hone their sense of 
patriotism and exalt it. Such a policy pursued by 
the state in relation to young people directly 
increases the responsibility of young people to 
comply with their rights and duties. Paying 
attention to the practical aspects of the article, 
patriotism is one of the main principles of 
loyalty to universal values. Patriotism is a 
concept inherent in high spirituality, faith in the 
Motherland, a sense of responsibility and 
awareness of duty to the motherland and nation. 
Patriotism is extremely multifaceted, constantly 
improving and developing in the process of 
historical, social, political, economic 
development. The more the interests, dignity, 
fate, prospects of the motherland are 
understood, the higher the sense of the 
motherland in people. Therefore, each of us 
should consider working with young people as 
our duty. "We all know well: the period from 15 
to 18 years old is the most delicate, most 
complex period in human life. At this age, human 
consciousness, behavior and morality, spiritual 
image are completely formed. 
     Who can guarantee that in the future they will 
grow up to be perfect people if we leave our 
children who have not yet lost their bones to 

their state and do not engage in upbringing, 
science and spirituality? Who will we put in the 
hands of our society, the future of our state? 
When we think of the perspective of our society, 
the fate of our nation, the confession, the 
happiness of happiness, we must first find the 
answer to this question."  
    Of course, the achievement of this task will not 
be by the power of one organization or office. As 
far as the future of the nation and the state is 
concerned, all state and non-state organizations 
in this case should be joined together. In the era 
of our republic, rich in development and change, 
human development in every possible way is 
the demand and need of the present. Youth 
education is the most pressing problem of our 
time. Children are the future of our state, not 
family and parents. The fate of the future 
generation requires great responsibility from 
our society and, therefore, from each of us. In 
every family and every society wants its 
offspring to grow into spiritually mature people. 
School, family, neighborhood and public 
cooperation are important in increasing the 
level of educational work among young people, 
developing its various methods, solving such a 
huge responsible, honorable task. In the past 
period, there were good phrases "your father 
and mother of seven armies", when our children 
swore something, everyone who was walking 
down the street did not look indifferent and 
everyone understood this correctly, and now, 
when they are given such events, they are taken 
to the kurmas and given to certain parents, they 
work in the grave" what do you do, Innovative 
reforms in the education system: through the 
eyes of scientists and young people. Currently, 
crime is on the rise as a result of what has been 
done knowingly and unknowingly among young 
people. This is a consequence of the fact that 
parents pay little attention to the conditions for 
students not to waste their free time from 
classes or shut them down with the game and 
work they love. It is worth noting that the 
upbringing of a harmonious, patriotic healthy 
generation is not only the task of an elegant 
parent or educational institution, but we are all 
equally responsible for this. It should not be 
forgotten at all that for education-Garbia to take 
place correctly, there must be unity in the 
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Family, Educational Institution and the 
demands that Mahalla puts on young people. 
      The transition from one stage to another in 
the development of human society is expressed 
in the fact that the Enlightenment begins and the 
mature, conscious, educated people of the time 
spread spirituality and enlightenment. As a 
result, innovative reforms in the system of 
enlightened education: through the eyes of 
scientists and young people, people overcome 
spiritual dependence, fear and go down in 
history as the owner of incomparable strength, 
potential. As the president of the Republic of 
Uzbekistan Shavkat Mirziyoyev noted, “as the 
Wise Men of the East say, “the greatest wealth is 
intelligence and science, the greatest 
inheritance is good upbringing, the greatest 
poverty is ignorance!” Therefore, for all of us, 
the assimilation of modern knowledge, true 
enlightenment and the possession of a high 
culture should become a continuous vital need.” 
   One of the important issues is the formation of 
a system in our country so that citizens can live 
a peaceful peaceful life and ensure reliable 
protection of society from terrorist, subversive 
attacks, manifestations of crime that cause such 
an emergency as extremism in all forms, 
organized crime. Among the sectoral services of 
the internal affairs bodies, Special Service units 
have their place, and in the event of an 
emergency, in the capture of armed criminals, in 
the neutralization of devices at risk of an 
explosion or when the situation requires urgent 
measures, these service personnel are 
contacted, they are employees of a mobilized 
detachment performing special operations, 
sappers and cynologists of Employees of the 
Department of coordination of special 
operations of the Ministry of internal affairs of 
the Republic of Uzbekistan and its on-site 
structures ensure public order and safety in 
crowded places and holding public events. As a 
result of a quick and professional approach of 
employees of special units to work, destructive 
forces are neutralized and rudeness is repelled. 
Criminals are captured and the illegal 
circulation of weapons and drugs is prevented. 
Employees performing such responsible service 
tasks are brought up in the spirit of patriotism, 
they are required to have strict life views, a 

sense of responsibility for the future of the 
Motherland, the qualities of patience, courage, 
self-confidence, self-control and loyalty to their 
profession, to have strict skills in applying 
modern weapons, techniques and special tools, 
theoretical and practical knowledge These 
requirements provide a new innovative 
approach to training mature specialist deaf 
people for this Sokha, modern information in 
the learning process. Innovative reforms in the 
education system: in the eyes of scientists and 
young people, the organization of training, 
retraining and professional development of 
personnel using communication technologies 
effectively necessitates. 
   Taking into account the specificity of the 
duties of the serviceman, which are performed 
by law enforcement agencies, in particular, 
special units of Internal Affairs bodies, it is 
necessary to quickly carry out a qualitative 
assessment of the task of providing the 
educational process with special educational 
literature, educational-methodical and practical 
manuals. Today, using their advanced foreign 
experience, it will be appropriate to create 
educational immersion complexes in the eyes of 
scientists and young people in the educational 
system, which are brought closer to real 
situations in order to improve special combat 
skills and train employees who will serve in 
special units of law enforcement agencies of the 
Republic in the future and to move in. 
   Today, The Motherland is tasked with creating 
the embodiment of innovative reforms in a new 
education system that will serve as an example 
for young people: harmonious people, modern 
heroes through the eyes of scientists and young 
people. Only mature people can build a free and 
prosperous Motherland, a free and prosperous 
life, which our independent motherland has as 
its supreme goal, turning harmonious, noble 
ideas into their life beliefs. Therefore, in our 
renewed Society, high attention is paid to 
raising perfect people by educating a healthy 
generation, forming the spirituality of a free 
citizen, raising spiritual and educational work to 
a high level. Perfection is a set of many original 
human qualities and qualities, such as kindness, 
justice, correctness, conscience, honor, will, 
entrepreneurship, fortitude. As mentioned 
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above, the idea of a perfect person has long been 
a noble dream of our people, an integral part of 
the spirituality of the nation. 
In conclusion, we can say that our people have 
wonderful habits, traditions from time 
immemorial, love for the land, holy knowledge 
of the mother and the motherland as a prostrate 
person, not lying, not betraying someone else's 
right, respect for the older one, and honor the 
younger one are among them. These are 
permeated with the life, lifestyle, spirituality 
and mentality of our people. When such thought 
is considered, it becomes clear that in these 
requirements of our ancestors, the most 
necessary qualities for society and Man are 
mentioned. The descendants of those whose 
faith is firmly established will grow up to be 
worthy children who have consolidated these 
characteristics in themselves. Therefore, our 
homeland is investing all its efforts and 
opportunities in the younger generation, in its 
upbringing. 
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