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Intellectual leg of clothing main from the 

features one , his everyone to the circumstances 
adapting is to leave . Unconscious from smells 
protector and leg diseases prevention receiver 
disinfectant the device presence ( shown in 
Figure 1 ). 

Figure 1 Intellectual leg clothes external 
appearance 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 
Every time leg clothes when untied and 

when wearing automatic turn on device to work 
falls and smoke harvest being leg clothes bad 
smell and from bacteria cleaning up will give . 
Smoke main characteristics one this his leg 
clothes don't care is considered and to the cloth 
sure effect shows 

Intellectual leg of clothing top and bottom 
part water , oil and dust impermeable from the 
material is prepared . This is a feature his 
endurance and long service to do assured will 
give . 

 
Figure 2 Intellectual leg clothes structural 

parts 
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Our goal Uzbekistan in the area 
intellectual leg clothes work release develop 
them good quality and cheap in prices sell 
Europe this is also the case in other countries to 
the device have has been intellectual leg clothes 
work release in the field no . Disinfection on the 
device leg for Dangerous has been effects there 
is it's not . To him to go main product liquid in 
appearance being to pokak worn out in 
appearance will be Spiral burning in the device 
as a result poka the coil inside lights up and 
smoke harvest will be and this smoke through 
disinfection will be done . 

Disinfection to the front of the device the 
air driving mini hydraulic that gives compressor 
placed will be This is a device the smoke leg to 
clothes absorption assured will give . 
Intellectual leg the lower part of the garment 
from rubber prepared will be He is very strong 
mud and watery from the roads easily to walk 
assured will give . Foot of clothing validity the 
duration is also appropriate long for a period of 

time stretches . It is seasonal leg clothes being 
all to the seasons flexible Because leg of clothing 
bottom in the part ventilation system there is . 
In it valves of the year Hot days open , cold when 
it comes down closed if will be Disinfection from 
the device coming out smoke leg of clothing 
internal to the temperature effect does not show 
. He is always moderate Intellectual leg of 
clothing again one preferred side this simple leg 
from clothes different respectively special to 
opportunities has Intellectual leg clothes men 
and Women for different different size and in 
colors work will be released  

Another one addition device disinfectant 
bucket is considered This is your bucket main 
characteristics one home to the conditions and 
to the office  is adaptation . A bucket and a leg 
unconscious from smells eliminate is enough 
and smoke using sweet expression with effect 
shows . Bucket high in the part turn on turn off 
for button is located being disinfection process 
done increase for service does 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Figure 3 Disinfection bucket 
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 On the side of the bucket support source 

is located for 1 day enough and again support is 
required .  Great advantages one from him 
everyone use takes For example home 
conditions in the family all from him the same 
use can Sweating in the legs contagious diseases 
there is people for separately disinfectant 
bucket use is required . 
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