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The living language is constantly 

changing in the process of its implementation, 
the change and development of the language is 
considered a necessary condition for its 
survival. National-ethnic, philosophical, moral, 
artistic-aesthetic views manifested in social 
activity are first embodied through language. 
President Of The Republic Of Uzbekistan 
Sh.M.The decree of Mirziyoev on October 21, 
2019 "on measures to radically increase the 
prestige and position of the Uzbek language as a 
state language"and the decree of October 20, 
2020 "on measures to further develop the 
Uzbek language in our country and improve 
language policy"and numerous decisions 
separately mention the need to increase the role 
and prestige of the state language at an 
international level, In particular, special 
attention is paid to increasing the prestige of the 
Uzbek language as a language of Science, and the 
need to increase the effectiveness of scientific 
research related to the historical progress of our 
native language and its prospects, and to 
radically improve its quality is emphasized.  

Today, Uzbek linguistics has fully 
reached a new qualitative stage, dramatically 
expanding the scope of serious research on 
issues of Applied and theoretical linguistics, and 
in the context of globalization, Uzbek linguistics 
has entered the world arena with the practical 
proof of the concept of “man is the center of the 
universe. 

In scientific research, the features of the 
rich expressiveness of the Uzbek language, the 
facets of subtle meaning are expressed in 
scientific feedback based on the study of our 
unique spiritual heritage created in our national 
language. We think that the reader who got 
acquainted with this book and articles will once 
again instill in his mind the feeling of attention 
and respect for our native language. 

Uzbek, one of the oldest and richest 
languages in the world, is a symbol of national 
identity and independent statehood for our 
people, an invaluable spiritual wealth, a great 
value that occupies an extremely important 
place in the political-social, spiritual-
educational development of our country. Over 
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the years, our native language has acquired a 
solid legal basis and high status. Currently, 
Uzbek language is actively used in all aspects of 
our life – state and Society Management, 
interstate relations, science, education, 
medicine, culture and art, playing baralla from 
international pulpits. 

In general, the future, position, prestige 
of the Uzbek language is not provided by anyone 
from abroad. Language is our greatest asset 
passing through our ancestors. The fact that our 
language will gain even higher status and 
prestige in the future depends on our own 
desire, pride, determination. 
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